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August saw a significant pivot in the global macroeconomic landscape. Since the mini-banking 
crisis in March (remember that?), market expectations for the US economy have moved from a 
hard landing to a soft one, and now no landing at all.  

Based on the most recent US economic data, the world’s largest economy is now faced with 
accelerating economic growth – despite (or because of) higher interest rates. 

 

Source: US BEA, Atlanta Fed, Bloomberg, Quay Global Investors * 3Q GDP Estimate based on Atlanta Fed GDPNow (August 24) 

For regular Investment Perspective readers, the lack of recession in the US should come as no 
surprise. As we wrote in our articles in September 2022, December 2022 and February 2023, rising 
interest rates in the US have a stimulatory effect on the US economy due to higher levels of fixed 
rate household mortgage rates, very large government debt, and associated accelerating net 
government interest expense (i.e. government spending). 

Bond investors have seemingly capitulated on 2024 interest rate cut expectations, and long-end 
rates have been on the rise. And while the observed data in other economies is starkly weaker 
relative to the US, long-dated bonds in non-US jurisdictions have risen in sympathy (which we 
believe is unsustainable, an argument we will leave for another day).  

But as far as the US is concerned, if the Federal Reserve believes interest rates will slow the 
economy when the opposite is true, then further interest rate hikes will continue to work against 
their objective. It’s akin to: “no matter how much fuel we put on the fire, it simply just won’t go 
out”. 

Where does it all end? 

The light at the end of the tunnel may very well be the in data that kicked it off – US inflation.  
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Some thoughts on recent US CPI 

Over the past year, headline inflation in the US has reduced significantly, from a peak of 8.6% in 
July 2022 to 3.2% exactly one year later.  

Much of this declaration has had very little support from the shelter component of the data series, 
however, that is soon to change. Unlike most CPI calculations around the world, shelter costs 
account for an outsized third of headline US CPI (and around 40% of core CPI). And rent accounts 
for the majority of these costs.  

Therefore, rent seems like a very important component of the most watched data series this cycle. 
So, let’s dig in. 

 

Source: BLS, Quay Global Investors 

Let’s talk about rents 

Since early this year, private sector rental surveys (and publicly listed residential REITs) have 
reported a significant drop in rental growth since the ’21-’22 boom. And, as expected, annual 
shelter inflation in the recent CPI has also begun to decline from its peak. However, in the most 
recent CPI release, the monthly rental number bizarrely re-accelerated. 
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Source: BLS, Quay Global Investors 

As shelter makes up 33% of CPI, the 0.44% shelter print accounted for 0.14% of the total 0.16% CPI 
print. So, ex-shelter, the CPI was barely positive. Given shelter growth re-accelerated in the most 
recent release, we would expect some give-back next month.  

So, maybe some good short-term news in the offering?  

The wider point is, why is rental inflation still so high (5.3% monthly annualised) when private 
sector measures indicate rent growth has recently normalized (and in some areas, actually now 
recording negative growth)?  

The fact is the Bureau of Labor Statistics (BLS) measures the price changes in rental leases in such 
a way that a ‘vintage’ of price effects is captured by the monthly measure – that is, the monthly 
shelter data includes new rental leases plus past leases. Each monthly CPI release includes 11 
months of old rental data plus one month of new rental data.  

The BLS Spotlight on Statistics information page – Housing Leases in the U.S. Rental Market – 
provides more detailed explanations of this statistical quirk1. It also explains why the headline CPI 
data appears ‘sticky’ – it’s because a very large component of monthly data is backward-looking. 

This ‘lag effect’ is well visualized by the following chart, comparing private sector rental surveys 
and the actual rental inflation used in the CPI. 

 
1 https://www.bls.gov/spotlight/2022/housing-leases-in-the-u-s-rental-market/home.htm 
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Source: Zillow, BLS, St Louis Fred, Quay Global Investors  

In the most recent CPI release, annual rate of shelter inflation of 7.66% is now four months from 
the March peak (8.18%) and represents 93.7% of the peak rate (7.66% / 8.18%). In contrast, four 
months on from peak, the private sector rent data (Zillow / Apartment association) was on 
average 91% of peak. So, the deceleration from peak for both the CPI and private sector are 
broadly in line, albeit with the abovementioned lag. 

Assuming the shelter CPI catches up with the private sector rate of deceleration, next month the 
annual rent inflation will drop from 7.66% to 7.03% (reflecting 86% of peak), implying a monthly 
rate of just 0.09% (down from 0.44%).  

In fact, since we have almost a year of private sector rent deceleration, we can apply the same 
ratio to the CPI series and construct a very realistic forecast for the remainder of 2023. For 
example, nine months from peak, private annual rent growth was roughly half of the peak. 
Assuming the same for the CPI by December, shelter inflation will be 4.1% compared to the March 
peak of 8.2%. To get to such an outcome, the implied future monthly CPI shelter component looks 
like this: 
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Source: BLS, Quay Global Investors 

Given shelter accounts for 33% of headline CPI (and 40% of core), this data will provide a 
significant tailwind to the US dis-inflation story. How much of a tailwind? Let’s dig further.  

Extrapolating the CPI data 

Up until recently, the large declines in annual CPI have benefited from the so-called ‘base effect’. 
That is, large monthly CPI data rolling out of the annual series. This ended last month when the 
July 2022 monthly CPI data (0.0%) was replaced by the July 2023 data (0.2%). Hence, a 0.2% gain in 
annual CPI. 

This base effect is about to come into play again. After August (where the previous year CPI 
number was 0.2%) there are some bigger 2022 CPI numbers to roll out in the following months. 
Specifically, 0.4% in September and 0.5% in October. 
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Source: BLS, Quay Global Investors 

As rents decelerate (using known private sector data), and assuming no material change in the 
non-rent component of the CPI, annual headline US inflation falls to low 2's by December, and 
below 2% by January 2024 (as another large CPI number rolls out from the previous year).  

 

Source: BLS, Quay Global Investors 
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Of course, this forecast heavily relies on no material change in non-shelter CPI components, in 
which we have no real expertise. However, for CPI to accelerate from current levels (which some 
forecasters now expect), these components will need to overcome a significant disinflationary 
impulse from the known shelter data coming down the pike. 

Concluding thoughts 

It has been an interesting year. Despite the fastest pace of interest rate increases in a generation, 
asset prices are higher (both equities, and residential property), the labour market has remained 
resilient, economic growth is accelerating (in the US), and inflation is falling. 

Aside from our regular readers, this would have surprised most. If anything, this underlines our 
philosophy that macro investing is hard. Even if you get the macro calls right, predicting how 
investors will react can be even more difficult. As always, we prefer to focus on good quality 
companies with demand tailwinds, solid balance sheets and sensible management. 

However, for those who do focus on the macro, and in particular inflation, there may be some 
good news on the horizon. 

 

For more insights from Quay Global Investors, visit quaygi.com 
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